

**BID TABULATION**  
**PAPER PRODUCTS AND CLEANING SUPPLIES**  
**BID # 15-2056**  
**10:00 A.M. December 21, 2015**

		Supplyworks	86 Food Service	Pro-Source Distributors, Inc.	Harder Corp.	Gordon Food Service	SMS Ambassadors Corp	All American Poly	Central Poly-Bag Corp.	Interboro Packaging				
	<b>PAPER</b>	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE
1	TOILET PAPER 1-ply/1,000 Sheets, 96/CS	\$57.73	\$44.95	\$29.79	\$37.26	\$39.22	No Bid	No Bid	\$54.66	No Bid				
2	TOILET PAPER 2-ply/500 Sheets, 96/CS	\$38.14	\$37.50	\$26.79	\$27.50	\$32.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$51.60	No Bid				
3	TOWEL C-FOLD - WHITE, 16 Pack, 2,400/CS	\$22.52	\$19.95	\$12.19	\$16.67	\$18.02	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.70	No Bid				
4	TOWEL ROLL - BROWN, 800', 6/CS	\$26.77	\$24.49	\$13.82	\$17.20	\$19.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.70	No Bid				
5	TISSUE FACIAL , 100/Box, 30/CS	No Bid	\$24.09	\$14.19	\$13.65	\$16.39	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.70	No Bid				
6	TOILET PAPER, JUMBO 2-ply, 12/CS	No Bid	\$24.09	\$11.49	\$17.40	\$24.58	No Bid	No Bid	\$28.70	No Bid				
7	PAPER TOWEL ROLL, ENMOTION 1-ply, 10"x800', 6/CS	No Bid	\$49.95	\$30.80	\$42.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$58.66	No Bid					
8	TOWEL KITCHEN ROLL, 30/CS	\$22.10	\$24.93	\$14.96	\$19.80	\$18.03	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.66	No Bid				
9	8" x 600' WHITE ROLL TOWEL 2" Core, 2" Core, 6/CS	No Bid	\$36.49	\$17.99	\$23.90	\$34.52	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.66	No Bid				
10	TOWEL MULTI-FOLD WHITE, 4,000/CS	\$23.29	\$23.45	\$13.94	\$16.00	\$17.97	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.81	No Bid				
	<b>LINERS</b>	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE BID A	PRICE BID B	PRICE BID C	PRICE BID D	PRICE BID E
11	LINER 38X58 BLACK, 60 Gal, 1.2 Mil, 100/CS	\$20.35	\$26.50	\$15.24	\$18.50	\$58.06	\$25.95	\$14.69	\$15.10	\$16.24	\$13.84	\$10.98	\$9.68	\$8.82
12	LINER 33 x 40 BLACK HIGH DENSITY, 250/CS	\$17.54	\$28.96	\$13.73	\$23.90	\$28.83	\$29.95	\$13.18	\$12.40	\$15.72	\$13.68	\$11.34	\$9.72	\$9.72
13	LINER 24 x 23 BLACK, 10 Gal, .35 Mil, 1,000/CS	\$17.44	\$25.99	\$14.89	\$12.20	\$22.70	\$28.95	\$33.10	\$15.10	\$15.72	\$13.24	\$10.68	\$13.24	\$13.24
14	SANI-SAC WAX LINERS, 500/CS	No Bid	\$26.09	\$18.94	\$20.00	\$29.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	LINER 24 x 23 RED BIO HAZARD, 1EA	\$16.63	\$29.95	\$15.85	\$26.20	\$21.79	\$60.00	No Bid	\$28.00	\$68.74	\$38.84	\$20.34	\$38.84	\$38.84
16	LINER 46 x 50 BLACK, 50 Gal, 1.35 Mil, 100/CS	\$23.91	\$31.95	\$20.49	\$22.50	\$30.20	No Bid	\$16.54	\$17.90	\$32.48	\$26.84	\$22.98	\$26.84	\$26.84
17	LINER 24 x 33 BLACK, 15 Gal, 8 Mic, 1,000/CS	\$15.77	\$36.95	\$19.64	\$22.40	\$36.03	\$38.50	\$49.88	\$19.00	\$24.98	\$16.85	\$16.82	\$16.82	\$16.82
18	LINER RED BIO HAZARD BAG, 33 Gal, 1.2 Mil, 200/CS	\$32.05	\$42.95	\$27.99	\$16.10	\$24.27	\$62.95	No Bid	\$19.00	\$32.82	\$26.48	\$20.84	\$18.82	\$16.82
	<b>CHEMICALS</b>	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE
19	CLOROX PRO QUAT ALL PURP, 128 OZ, 2/CS	\$62.99	\$58.28	\$33.27	\$44.96	\$69.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
20	SOAP STYLE FOAM ANTI BACTERIAL, 1,000 ML, 6/CS	No Bid	\$88.74	\$30.28	\$31.18	\$37.37	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
21	H2OR 118 CONCENTRATE, 1 GAL, 4/CS	No Bid	\$149.08	\$36.92	\$30.70	\$116.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
22	GREEN WORKS GEN BATHROOM, 128 OZ, 2/CS	No Bid	\$59.96	\$31.12	\$46.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
23	HEALTHCARE GERMICIDAL S W/BLEACH, 32 OZ, 6/CS	\$76.08	\$69.95	\$9.94	\$80.70	\$59.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				

**BID TABULATION**  
**PAPER PRODUCTS AND CLEANING SUPPLIES**  
**BID # 15-2056**  
**10:00 A.M. December 21, 2015**

		Supplyworks	86 Food Service	Pro-Source Distributors, Inc.	Harder Corp.	Gordon Food Service	SMS Ambassadors Corp	All American Poly	Central Poly-Bag Corp.	Interboro Packaging				
24	REFILL HEALTHCARE CLORO HYDRO PROX WIPES, 2/CS	No Bid	\$64.90	<b>\$29.06</b>	\$66.35	\$33.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
25	GREEN WORKS GEN PURP CLEANER, 128 OZ, 2/CS	No Bid	\$66.89	<b>\$26.19</b>	\$37.20	\$46.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
26	SOLID GREEN DFE ALK LAU DETERGENT, 6LB, 2/CS	\$68.12	<b>\$66.99</b>	No Bid	\$96.77	\$171.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
27	NXT PURELL SANITIZER, 1,000 ML, 10/CS	\$102.00	\$76.50	<b>\$39.94</b>	\$83.08	\$34.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
28	CITRUS DISINFECTANT SPRAY, AEROSOL, 12/CS	No Bid	\$66.99	<b>\$39.99</b>	\$41.32	\$21.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
29	SOLID GREEN OXYGINATED, 5.5 LB, 2/CS	\$83.77	<b>\$66.99</b>	No Bid	\$120.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
30	SOAP STYLE FOAM HAIR & BODY, 1,000 MIL, 6/CS	No Bid	\$69.88	<b>\$24.14</b>	\$27.50	\$48.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
31	KLING 9% TOILET BOWL CLEANER, QUART, 12/CS	\$23.39	\$59.68	\$23.15	<b>\$21.94</b>	\$14.79	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
	<b>MISCELLANEOUS</b>	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE
32	ROADRUNNER ICEMELT, 50 LB BAG EA	\$9.98	\$16.99	<b>\$7.39</b>	\$10.34	\$10.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
33	MAXITHINS MAXI PADS #4, 250/CS	<b>\$27.45</b>	\$45.67	\$41.94	\$38.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
34	TRACTION MELT, 50 LB BAG EA	\$8.91	\$13.99	<b>\$6.30</b>	\$8.56	\$7.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
35	INDUSTRIAL STRENGTH BLUE ICEMELT, 50 LB BAG EA	No Bid	\$14.99	<b>\$6.30</b>	\$8.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
36	DISPENSER ROLL TOWEL PUSH PADDLE, 1 EA	\$36.55	\$44.49	<b>\$15.00</b>	\$37.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
37	MOP HANDLE WOOD/FIBERGLASS 60" SIDE GATE, 1 EA	\$7.09	\$18.99	<b>\$6.79</b>	\$9.05	\$10.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
38	ADX PURELL ADV SANTIZER, 1,200 ML, 4/CS	<b>\$22.99</b>	\$63.45	\$39.94	\$72.48	\$52.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
39	FRESHWAVE GEL, 8 OZ, 12 CS	No Bid	\$69.99	<b>\$26.49</b>	\$53.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
				All dispensers included.						Shipping not included in orders under \$500.				